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Tom Green County Commissioners’ Court 
April 13th, 2004 

The Commissioners’ Court of Tom Green County, Texas, met in Regular Session April 
13th, 2004 in the Edd B. Keyes Building, with the following members present: 

Clayton Friend, Commissioner of Precinct #1 
Karl Bookter, Commissioner of Precinct #2   
Jodie R. Weeks, Commissioner of Precinct #3 
Richard Easingwood, Commissioner of Precinct #4  
Michael D. Brown, County Judge  

 
1. County Judge, Michael Brown, called the meeting to order at 8:31 AM. 
2. The Pledge of Allegiance to the United States and the Texas Flags was recited. 

Commissioner Weeks offered the invocation. 
3. Commissioner Easingwood moved to accept the Consent Agenda as presented, 
followed by an amendment deleting Hudson Road from item I-4.  Commissioner 
Weeks seconded the motion and the amendment.  The following items were 
presented:  

A. Approved the Minutes of the Regular Meeting of March 22nd, 2004.  
B. Approved the Minutes of Accounts Allowable (Bills) from March 23rd – 

April 13th, 2004 in the amount of $1,442,247.96.                                                              
Purchase Orders from March 22nd – 26th, 2004 in the amount of $12,203.64, 
from March 29th – April 2nd, 2004 in the amount of $17,623.90 and from 
April 5th – 9th, 2004 in the amount of $32,677.62.  

C. Accepted Personnel Actions as presented:                                                                                       
The following salary expenditures are being presented for your Approval: 
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WERMUTH, Arthur ��������	
��
�

�� �����	��� 4/01/04 13/1 ������������� �

WILLIAMS, Sharon S. ���������� ���	��� 4/01/04 13/1 ������������ �

LAND, Kenneth R. ����	��� �����	��� 4/01/04 19/4 �� !������ �

DOMINGUEZ, Ricardo �"�� �����	��� 3/30/04 N/A ���� ���#��� �

WILLIAMS, Katherine $	%���&� �����	��� 3/22/04 '��� ���� ��#��� �

RODRIGUEZ, Joe H. �"�� �����	��� 3/24/04 ��(� ���� ��#��� �

CIMINO, Pamela $	%���&� �����	��� 4/07/04 ����� ������������ �

   
The following personnel actions are presented for Acknowledgement and as a matter of record: 
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URIAS, Amanda M. )��	
���
���	�����	#
�

*	�+	����� 3/18/04 � ��� �!�,��-����� �

CUMMINGS, Darrell .�	�� ���	�
��	#
� 3/24/04 �!��� �/���- ����� �
YOUNG, Venetia J. $	%���&� ���	�
��	#
� 3/30/04 '��� ���� ��#��� �
DECKER, Pamela $	%���&� ���	�
��	#
� 3/17/04 '��� �������#��� �
NOMBRANO, Aurora $	%���&� ���	��+�
�� 3/31/04 ������ �-,���/����� �
MENDEZ, Rafaela M. 0�0*� �����&�1

������ 11/1/03 ��(� �/� �������� �
LACK, Letitia 0�0*� �����&�1

������ 12/1/03 ��(� ����!�!������ �
WILMOTH, John A. 0�0*� �����	��� 4/1/04 ��(� ������  ����� �
HERNANDEZ, Ramiro .�	�� ���	�
��	#
� 4/11/04 ��(� �� �!�!������ �
MEDRANO, Tina R. 0�0*� �����&�1

������ 3/1/04 ��(� ��,���� ����� �
FAZ, Jerry N. 0�0*� �����&�1

������ 3/16/04 ��(� ���/���/����� �
SKELTON, Gordon �"�� *�#22��� 3/26/04  ��(� ���� ��#��� �
CHATFIELD, Mary $	%���&� ���	�
��	#
� 4/16/04 ����� ���-��/ ����� �
BURNETT, Martha 0�0*� ���	�
��	#
� 4/7/04 ��(� ����,�  ����� �
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The following personnel actions are presented for Grants as a matter of record: 
����� � � �  �  
 

 
D. Accepted Justice of the Peace Precincts # 1-4 Fee Collection Reports, pursuant 

to Section 114.044 of the Local Government Code, for March 2004 as a matter 
of record.  (Filed in County Clerk’s Office for review). 

E. Approved the sale of Tom Green County Tax Trustee Property of Lots 2&3, 
Block 20, Lake Concho Estates Subdivision to Elias and Christopher Luna in 
the amount of $500.00.  (Recorded with these minutes.)   

F. Accepted March 2004 Indigent Health Care Monthly Report of Expenditures as 
presented. (Recorded with these minutes.) 

G. Approved the Release and Pledge of Collateral Funds from Texas State Bank. 
H. Approved request by Verizon Southwest to bury communication line in the west 

right of way of Thompson Road in Precinct #1. 
I. Approved request by Verizon Southwest to bury communication line in the 

County right of way at the followings locations: 
1. Spring Creek Lane 
2. US Highway 277 on John Curry Road 
3. White Lane 

J. Accepted the February 2004 Solid Waste Report as a matter of record.  
(Recorded with these minutes.) 

The motion passed unanimously. 
5. Becky Harris, Roy K. Robb Post Adjudication Facility Director, reported that there are 

currently 18 residents.  They are awaiting the arrival of 5 referrals, one of which is a 
new referral from Tarrant County.  There will be a total of 5 graduating out this month.  
Cochran County has made inquiries for possible referrals.  The Level 5 funds, that were 
being used by Counties to supplement the cost of residents, has been depleted for this 
fiscal year and may have a direct impact on future referrals.  A Bee County resident has 
been removed as a result of the funding loss.  The Summer Program has been planned 
and brochures will be going out to promote summer referrals.  The Juvenile Board 
tabled a decision on the acceptance of female residents pending more information on 
several issues including available bed space.  El Paso County has scheduled a tour of 
the facility for consideration of possible placement.  The JJCT has hired lobbyist to 
address issues concerning juvenile facilities including the Level 5 funding.  (Report 
filed with these minutes.)                                                                              Judge 
Brown moved to accept the Roy K. Robb Facility report as presented.  
Commissioner Bookter seconded the motion and all voted in favor.  

6. Commissioner Easingwood distributed graphs showing the taxes levied by each taxing 
entity, with the major portion of taxes collected (approximate) being used by the school 
districts (60%), followed by the City of San Angelo, the County (14%), and special 
districts such as water & hospital districts.  He also distributed a graph showing how 
Tom Green County’s tax dollars are distributed, Criminal Justice (59%), General 
Administration (11%), Health & Welfare (9%), Asset Management (7%), Culture and 
Recreation (6%), Other (8%).  (Recorded with these minutes.) 
Judge Brown moved to adopt a Resolution resolving that Tom Green County 
expresses it’s firm and absolute opposition to the Governor’s proposal dealing 
with artificial caps, school refinance and unfunded mandates.  Commissioner 
Friend seconded the motion and all voted in favor.  (Recorded with these minutes.) 

7. Brigitte R. Rogers, Representative of the Texas Silver Haired Legislature, expressed the 
concerns of the Seniors regarding the increased tax burden on those with fixed incomes.  
The Court explained the alternative actions that could become necessary in the event of 
the funding cut, including many losses of services that some seniors depend on as well 
as a possible loss of homestead exemptions. The Court also explained that the County 
salaries for its employees are approximately 35% lower than the City salaries.  The 
funding would have to be made up from another source and this would just be another 
example of shifting the responsibility.   The Court further explained that until they have 
the projected budget recommendations from the departments and the figures from the 
Appraisal District on the values, they cannot make a decision.   The Court took no 
action at this time.  Ms. Rogers requested to be placed back on the agenda for next 
month.  (Ms. Rogers presentation recorded with these minutes) 

8. Judge Brown moved to enter into negotiations with West Central Net/Wireless for 
RFP 04-017 “Internet Service for CAT-D Grant” (Computer Access Technology 
for the Disabled).  Commissioner Friend seconded the motion and all voted in 
favor.  
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17.  Hubert Glen Rust and Anina Maurier addressed the Court regarding property that has 
been divided since in the early 80’s with 911 addressing and taxation, but had never had a 
subdivision plat on the 2 lots of 2.5 acres each.  In 1996 a survey was done and metes and 
bounds descriptions done for the tracts.  Mr. Rust and Ms. Maurier requested that the 
owner be allowed to formalize this subdivision by deeds with the metes and bounds 
descriptions attached and waive the standard notification on adjacent property owners.   
Commissioner Weeks moved to approve the division of properties in the Live Oak 
Creek Sub-Division as presented through metes and bounds procedures.  
Commissioner Friend seconded the motion and all voted in favor.  
9. Judge Brown moved to approve the $71.00 notary bond funding for the Indigent 

Health Office through a line item transfer to be determined at a later date.  
Commissioner Weeks seconded the motion and all voted in favor. 

10. Passed on the awarding of RFB 04-020 “2004 New Model Crew Cab ¾ Ton Pickup 
Truck”. 

11. Commissioner Easingwood moved to award the RFB 04-021 “Janitorial Supplies” 
to House of Chemicals, Wagner Supply, West Central Poly and West Texas Fire 
Extinguisher for a one year contract based upon recommendations by Johnny 
Grimaldo, as presented.  Commissioner Weeks seconded the motion and all voted 
in favor.   (Recorded with these minutes.) 

12. Commissioner Weeks moved to award the asbestos abatement contract to 
Advanced Environmental at a cost of $23,613.00 for the Keyes Building Basement 
and the Court Street Annex Bathroom remodel area and authorize the unit prices 
as presented and as needed.  Commissioner Friend seconded the motion and all 
voted in favor.  (Note:  The Sheriff’s Office is being evaluated and is not included with 
this bid price.  Recorded with these minutes)  

13. Don Killam, explained that some structural damage has been discovered in the Election 
Office.                                                                                                                                
Judge Brown moved to hire and enter into contract negotiations with Bill 
McClanahan a Structural Engineer, as a Professional Service for a design and 
evaluation in the Keyes Building.  Commissioner Friend seconded the motion and 
all voted in favor.  

14. Judge Brown moved to adopt a Resolution declaring April 18th – 24th, 2004 as 
County Government Week and encourage all it’s citizens to become more aware 
of the history and more involved in the future of Tom Green County.  
Commissioner Bookter seconded the motion and all voted in favor.  (Recorded with 
these minutes.) 

15. Judge Brown moved to authorize the application for continued Membership in the 
Texas Library Systems and authorize the County Judge to sign all necessary 
documents.  Commissioner Weeks seconded the motion and all voted in favor.   
(Recorded with these minutes.)  

16. There was no Interlocal Agreement between Christoval Fresh Water District and 
Precincts 2&4 Road and Bridge to be considered as this was in error.  Dismissed. 

 
19.  Commissioner Weeks moved to adopt the proposal by Trashaway Services, Inc., 

utilizing the San Angelo Land Fill by allowing County residents to go once a 
month, beginning June 1, 2004, to the land fill and dump residential trash, at no 
cost to them, with the presentation of their current residential electric bill and 
drivers license for identity.  The Wall, Christoval and Grape Creek dump sites will 
be closed beginning June 1, 2004, thus saving the County further losses of tax 
dollars in operational expenses and the County Judge is authorized to sign any 
necessary papers.  Commissioner Friend seconded the motion and all voted in 
favor.   (Proposal is recorded with these minutes.) 

18.  No action was taken regarding the Annual Clean-up for Rural Residents of Tom 
Green County. 
 
20. Commissioner Friend moved to modify the uniform line item for Road and Bridge 

Precincts 1&3 to provide safety shirts for the employees of Road & Bridge 
Precincts 1 &3 at the additional cost specified and as recommended by the County 
Risk Manager.  Commissioner Weeks seconded the motion and all voted in favor. 

21. Commissioner Bookter moved to notate, for the record, that Green Road (from 
Robbie Jones road 1.62 miles to a cattle guard) is a County maintained road, by 
the Prescription Law instead of a deed, and has recently been upgraded.   
Commissioner Easingwood seconded the motion and all, except for Commissioner 
Weeks (Absent at the time of the vote), voted in favor.  
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22. There were no matters discussed relating to the Tom Green County Subdivision and 
Manufactured Home Rental Community Development Regulations.   

23. Judge Brown moved to approve the following line item transfers: 
Fund: General Fund 
       Budget  Budget 
Department   Account  Increase  Decrease 
010  Records Management 0475  Equipment 1,236.00 
192  Contingency  0601  Reserves    1,236.00 

Commissioner Friend seconded the motion and all, except for Commissioner Weeks 
(Absent at the time of the vote), voted in favor.  (Recorded with these minutes.) 

 
24. Future Agenda Items: 

1. Consider adopting Resolution regarding Soil Stewardship Week. 
2. Consider possible increase in liability insurance. 
3. Consider issues regarding handgun policy trade ins and buy backs. 

 
25. Announcements: 

1. Dianna Spieker, County Treasurer and President Elect of State Treasurers 
Association, requested the acknowledgment of the State Treasurers’ 
Association’s Resolution opposing the proposed tax cap that is similar to 
the Resolution passed today by the Tom Green County Commissioners’ 
Court.  (Recorded with these minutes.) 

2. The Mullins Cemetery Association received funds for the installation of an 
ornamental ironwork fence and a historical marker was placed at the 
cemetery.   

3. Myron Schmiedekamp, Parks Superintendent, and his crew were 
complimented by the Court on the fine job they do in the parks and 
cemeteries of the County. 

4. The City/County Surplus Auction Date has been set for June 12, 2004. 
5. County Government Week begins next week and a “Mock” 

Commissioners’ Court is scheduled for Monday, April 19th, 2004 at 9:00 
AM for County students. 

6. A special meeting today at the Commissary at Ft. Concho from 1:00 until 
4:00 with the Ag Commissioner from Washington. 

7. Senator Cornyn will be at the Visitors Center, Saturday, April 17th, 2004 at 
3:00 PM. 

8. Congressman Stenholm will be the guest speaker today at the Chamber of 
Commerce Luncheon at the Holiday Inn.   

26. Judge Brown adjourned the meeting at 11:10 AM. 
 
As per HB 2931, Section 4: 
I, Elizabeth McGill, County Clerk of Tom Green County, Texas do hereby attest that 
this is an accurate accounting of the proceedings of the Commissioners’ Court 
Meeting that met in Regular Session on April 13th, 2004.  

                                                                                                                 
 I hereby set my hand and seal to this record April 27th, 2004.  
 
 
 
__________________________________ 
Elizabeth McGill, County Clerk and  
Ex-officio Clerk of the Commissioners’ Court 
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Tom Green County  

RESOLUTION 

WHEREAS, county government is the oldest fonn oflocal government in the United States; and 

WHEREAS, county government in Texas has been a major provider of services to Texas citizens since the early days 
of the Republic, and, today, all 254 Texas counties supply dozens of services to their citizens; and 

WHEREAS, counties are on the front line of addressing many of the nation's most critical issues including 
environmental protection, indigent health care, special assistance for the elderly, job training, and public safety, and, 

WHEREAS, the mission of Texas county government is to meet the needs of all our citizens without placing an undue 
hardship on local taxpayers, 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that the Commissioners' Court of Tom Green County of the State of 
Texas, hereby proclaims April 18th 

- 24t\ 2004 as County Government Week, and encourages all its citizens to become 
more aware ofthe history and more involved the future of Tom Green County. 

Michael D. Brown, County Judge 

ATTEST: 
Before me. the undersigned authority. on this day personally appeared Michael D. Brown. County Judge; W. Clayton Friend. Commissioner. Pct. 1; Karl W. Bookter. 
Commissioner, Pcl. 2; Jodie R. Weeks. Commissioners. Pct 3; and Richard S. Easingwood, Jr.• Commissioner. Pct. 4, Tom Green County. known to me to be the persons 
whose names are subscribed to the foregoing instrument and acknowledged to me that they executed the same for the purposes. therein expressed and in the capacity 
therein stated. Subscribed and acknowledged before me by the said County Officials. on this the I .9-f It day of Lf.ahiL .2002. 
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RFB 04-021" JANITORIAL SUPPLIES SPREADSHEET 4-05-04 
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ITEMI DESCRIPTION 
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ITEM# DESCRIPTION 

32 Ol8infectant, Pine, 1gal 
33 Du8I Mop treatment, Aerosol Non-streaking, 121cs 
U FloorFlnsh restorer,BounceBack Sparton 5gat NI 
H Floor Cleaner, Neutral, 6galfcs 
31 Furniture Polish, SprayCan, Lemon16-200z 12p1cs 
37 Glasa Cleaner,Ready-to-U8e,alcohol,fast diy, 1ge1 
38 Stripper Floor, ,Ceat 1121 Cello or equal 

38 Stripper Was, Aeroeo/(for baseboard) 230z can 121cs 
40 ToIIeI Bowl Cleaner 23-~ Hydrogen Chloride, 

Inhibited Ack:l12qt1cs 
41 Toilet Bowl Cleaner, N.A.B.C 
42 Lime Away 19a1 
43 Urinal Deodorant, 40z Block, 121cs 
44 Urinll DeodonInt, screen,SweetPee 121ca 
41 Commode Brush 
48 Cover, Oust mop 24" 
47 Cover, Dust mop 36" 
48 IMop Head 240z webFeet ... IMop Head 160z Colton 
10 jMop Heed 160z Rayon, for waxing 
11 'Mop Head 20 QZ Rayon 
12 Mop Heed 240z Rayon 
53 ,Mop Bucket, w/rollare 7 Wringer 35Qt RubberMald 
54 Toilet Plunger 
IS IBags, R nt for Napkin Disposal 
It Shampoo Carpet 61 1 gal 
17 Shampoo carpet lOll extraction 
It Graffiti 11ImOVeI', Certified or equal 
II Jumbo Tlaaue 
10 Floor Restorer, SnapBack. S.C. Johnson 1 gal NS., Lerge Food Service Gloves 
82 Bath Soap 1 112Dz Unwtllpped 

Wagner Supply WTX Fire Ext House of Chem 
Qty PrIce Qty PrIce QIy PrIce 
4t:a S 21.00 4'ca 5.28gaI 4'cs $ 29.40 
12JaJ $ 25.50 121cs $ 30.06 121ca $ 39.00 
MCh $ 38.00 Sgal $ 42.15 no bid 

nobld 4t:a $ 17." 4'ca $ 20.40 
no bid 121ca $ 26.25 121cs $ 28.90 

4t:a S 11.80 4'cs 3.27ga1 4cs $ 17.80 
4t:a • 22.'" No BId 4'cs $ 28.80 
12JaJ $ 25.00 12-2Oaz $ 25.59 121cs $ 39.36 

121ca $ 19.68 

,_ 
$ 15.82 121cs $ 23.88 

121cs $ 19.00 
1_ 

$ 18.44 nobld 
4t:a $ 21.80 4gaI 7.S1ea 4'cs $ 26.00 

121box $ 4.50 121cs $ 4.58 121bx $ 5.86 
12.11K $ 7.70 121cs $ 17.75 121bx $ 8.28 
each $ 2.00 MCh $ 1.83 ea $ 2.10 
each $ 6.00 121ca S.7Oea ea $ 10.53 
MCh S 1.'" 121cs 7.58ea ea $ 14.60 
each $ 4.45 121ca 4.13M ee $ 7.28 
each $ 3.90 121ca 2.e5et ee $ 2.80 
each $ 3.70 12/ca 3.43ee ea $ 3.68 
MCh $ 3.80 121ca 4.3gea ea $ 4.19 
each $ 4.70 121ca 3." ea $ 4.62 
MCh $ 3US each $ 42.14 ea $ 48.00 
each $ 7.00 each $ 5.84 .. $ 5."6 

no bid 4Ica $ 17.• 500Jca $ 23.57 
4'cs $ 31.60 4t:a 6.28g11 41cs $ 65.68 
4'cs $ 31.60 4t:a 5.2<1g111 41cs $ 28.00 
121ca $ SUIO 12..2Qoz $ 43.96 121cs $ 41.64 
121cs $ 19.80 12ro1ls $ 19.19 cs $ 23.25 
<4Ica $ 44.00 6gaI 13.64ga1 no bid 

1001b0x $ 1.45 100each S.68bx 10Q(pk $ 0.75 
? ? No Bid no bid 

Central Poly Grainger 
QIy PrIce QIy PrIce 

No BId No BId 
NoBlet No BId 
NoBlet No BId 
No BId No BId 
No BId No BId 
No BId No BId 
No BId No BId 
No BId No BId 
No Bid No BId 
No Bid No BId 
No Bid No BId 
No Bid No BId 
No BId No BId 
No Bid NoBlet 
No BId No BId 
No BId No BId 
No Bid No BId 
No BId No BId 
No BId No BId 
No Bid No Bid 
No Bid No BId 
No BId No BId 
No BId No BId 
No BId No BId 
No BId No BId 
No BId No Bid 
No BId No BId 
No BId No BId 
No BId No BId 
No BId No BId 
No Bid No BId 
No Bid No Bid 

e::J )
CL. 
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NS-No Substitute 
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pI)... 

TOIII Green CoIIII(y 
Stm Angelo, IX 

'-'J.". / 

DESCRIPTION; ~ 

44 
Advanced 

~ 
Asbestos 
Removal 

Vanco 
Insulation 
AbatementKeyes Bldg. &. 

Court Street .Annex 

Bid#1 Keyes Bldg. Stq~~ Sci'i~x.d) ~fli18l>~ $ $ 

Bid #2 Court Street 
Annex 

$ 

4~lbO 
$ 

.o74',co 
S 

4.~~.tD 
$ $ 

, 

I 

Bid #3 Lump Sum 
for Bids #1 &. #2 

$ 

~3JDI3~ 
S 
.j;.f,/pl6. IX> 

S 
I .s9. •'i'1~ .IJD 

$ $ 

Unit Priees 

Floortilelmastic s.l. $ c;Q.ro S S. ,5" S~.OC> S $ 

PipinglElbows L£ $/~,6D $ \~.~5 $ 45.1» $ $ 

!ut ~(~30 Lf..)_ - ..--.. ~-
S~l'JX)f;O_J_1~~_ ~~~4~ $ 

--~ ..--.--..­ .......­ .....-- ­
s 

TERMS: ~ ~ QO~ r Total Award_______ 

Delivery Date: 
Bids Opened: 

4· 12.~D+ 
-4 ~ 12.-£)4 I : C6"~ 

Budget Amount 

Persons Present:":Dr~ WW\&I &a.n &...rWI &JtAJ3rd I Llo.k , 

&ot:&'~J 
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SYSTEM MEMBERSIDP APPLICATION FORM 
Authorization to Apply for New or Continuing System Membership 

LIBRARY NAME: -'T::..:oO!:m::......>;G:o::r.::::e;:,:e"'n~C""'o"'"illl ,ju.br"'" ___ San Angelo .......t..,yIl-'T..... .... Bu..ry.;<- CITY 


This Authorization for application should be completed only for the following reasons: 

• Your library is applying for new membership in the Texas Library System 
• Your library.wishes to continue its membership in the Texas Library System for the upcoming state fiscal year 

(SFY2005). 

All signatures are necessary. Current members of the Texas Library System MUST obtain all necessary signatures if they 
wish to continue their System membership during SFY2005. 

Signatures of city secretaries, county clerks, and so forth are not valid substitutions for the signatures ofmayors, city 
managers, or county judges. 

IF you are unable to obtain all necessary signatures before this form is due at the State Library, THEN send the State Library 
all other pages except this Authorization and indicate approximately when the Authorization for Application will be 
forthcoming. After obtaining the required signatures, mail this page to the Texas State Library to arrive no later than April 30. 

By sigllillg Ihis form, the applyillg library is certifYing that the information presented in its Annual Report for Local Fiscal 
Yea/' 2003 is complete alld accurate. Mail to; Texas State Library, P.O. Box 12927, Austin, TX 78711-2927 

AUTHORIZATION 

SIG:"\:\ TL'RE or ~1ayor. City Manager, Dis
Chair. CounlY Judge. or School Superintend
ICm:k applicable one) 

trict Board 
ent 

Michael D. Brown 1 COilllty Judge 
Typewritten or printed name 

Larry D. Justiss. Libra[y Director 
Typewritten or printed name 

Syl Polunsky, Library Board Chair 
Typewritten or printed name 
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Proposal to Tom Green County Commissioners Court 

For Residential Free Dumping at the 


City of San Angelo Landfill 


Tom Green County is wanting to let the Citizens of the County to avail themselves of the 
City ofSan Angelo Landfill at no charge to the Citizen. With the concurrence with the 
City ofSan Angelo, Trashaway Services, Inc., Landfill Division proposes the following 
fees set up in the same way as we have with the City ofSan Angelo for the residents of 
the City. 

Fees to be paid to Trasbaway Services, Inc. for tipping at the landfill are as follows: 

1. 	 County Clean up: Car, Pickup and/or Trailer load, hauled by homeowner from 
residence, which contains brush, rubbish, garbage $23.00/ Ton with $0.50 
State Fee Surcharge per ton. This will be on an accumulative basis for the 
tonnage. 

2. 	 County Clean up Appliances: $6.00 per item; Plus $0.50 State Fee Surcharge. 
This will be charged per individual item. 

3. 	 County Clean up Brush: Clean cut brush with no rubbish or garbage in the load: 
$23.00 per ton. This will be on an accumulative basis for the tonnage. 

Trasbaway Services, Inc., will not accept for payment from Tom Green County any tires. 
Unless the individual is willing to pay for them personally. This service is for the 
Residents ofTom Green County only and Trasbaway Services, Inc. will not accept for 
disposal at the cost of Tom Green County any waste brought from a Commercial 
Business for disposal. 

It is proposed that for proofofresidence the individual shall present upon entering the 
landfill a current Electricity bill along with their drivers license or voter registration to 
validate they are residents ofTom Green County. 

4;~
Bobby 1. Pilkington 
General Manager 
Landfill Division 
Trasbaway Services, Inc. 
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Commissioners' Court 

Tom Green County 


Line-Item Transfers 

Michael D. Brown April8,2004 
County Judge 

Fund: General Fund 
Budget Budget 

Department Account Increase Decrease 

010 Records Management 0475 Equipment 1,236.00 
192 Contingency 0601 Reserves 1,236.00 

Reason 
Transfer funds for paper shredder. 

Department Head roved by Commissioners' Court 
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County Treasurers' Association of Texas 

ACHiEVING EXCELLENCE THROUGH EDUCATIOr,1 

Resolution 

WHEREAS County Treasurers provide sound fiscal accountability 
for the citizens of our counties, we support the reform of public 
school financing in the State of Texas. 

WHEREAS county governments have an excellent track record as 
good stewards of local tax dollars, despite the ongoing pressure of 
unfunded state mandates, as well as unforeseen local 
circumstances, which could cause financial instability for local 
governments, whose duly elected leaders have been entrusted by 
the voters with making fiscally conservative budgetary decisions; 

WHEREAS the County Treasurers' Association of Texas 
recognizes that local property taxpayers are struggling with the 
effect of continuous imposition of state unfunded mandates on 
counties, such as the potential increase in the valuation of 
residential homesteads be limited to three percent annually; 

WHEREAS such an artificial cap would grossly distort the current 
system of 100 percent valuations, shifting the property tax burden to 
business properties and further harming the state's economic 
development; and could result in radical cutbacks in services to 
local taxpayers, 

WHEREAS the only proposed shelter against continued delegation 
of unfunded state mandates on local governments does not provide 
a permanent, fail-proof section in the State Constitution that 
protects the local taxpayer; 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED THAT THE COUNTY 
TREASURERS ASSOCIATION OF TEXAS encourages the 
Governor and State Legislators to continue seeking a solution to 
public school finanCing without adversely affecting county 
government. 

Approved and Affirmed This Sill Day of April, 2004. 
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