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SP RFB 05-009 "STATE GRADE AND ROCK BASE" SPREADSHEET
12.17.04
Company % MA

Treated Untreated

Price per Yard price per Yard

State Grade #3 $28.50/TON $20.00/TON
State Grade #4 $29.50/TON $20.00/TON
State Grade #5 $19.50/TON $15.00/TON
Common Grade Base #2 NO BID $3.25/TON
Scalping (1/2 minus) NO BID $3.75/TON
Screening (chat) NO BID $3.75/TON
Grade FF Rock NO BID $13.00/TON
Location of Plant/Yard TURNER PIT 22 MILES NW OF SAN ANGELO
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RESOLUTION

WHEREAS, the Tom Green County Commissioners Court? finds it in the best interest of the citizens
of Tom Green County, that the Cluster Collections Pilot iject be operated for the period beginning
on March 1, 2005 and ending on August 31, 2005; and

WHEREAS, the project is a statewide project, which will include one host county with a formal fine
collections program and seven rural counties without formal fine collections programs; and
WHEREAS, Tom Green County agrees to serve as the host county and to hire and provide quarters
to a collections officer and a collections clerk who will provide collections services for the county
court and the justice courts in each of the following countics:iCoke, Concho, Irion, Menard, Runnels,
Schleicher, and Sterling counties (hereinafter referred to as the “Tom Green County Cluster”).
WHEREAS, the commissioners court of each county agreeing to participate in the project is
responsible only for providing the county’s portion of the matching funds required for the project,
as designated below; and

WHEREAS, the Tom Green County Commissioners Court has considered the proposed application
for state assistance for said project, in an amount not to exceed $35,000 for the total statewide project
costs, and authorizes the administrative director of the state Office of Court Administration to apply
for, accept, reject, alter, or terminate the grant; and

WHEREAS, the Tom Green County Commissioners Court agrees that Tom Green County
participate in the pilot project, with matching funds to be provided by Coke County in the amount
of $602.06, Concho County in the amount of $2,161.25, Irion County in the amount of $725.56,
Menard County in the amount of $1,250.44, Runnels Countjz in the amount of $632.94, Schleicher
County in the amount of $1,265.88, and Sterling County in the amount of $1,080.63, which totals
$7,718.75 and is the amount equal to one-fourth of the costs attributable to the participation of the
Tom Green County Cluster in the project; and

WHEREAS, the Tom Green County Commissioners Court agrees that in the event of loss or misuse
of the Criminal Justice Division funds, the Tom Green County Commissioners Court assures that

the funds will be returned to the Criminal Justice Division in full;
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NOW THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the Tom Green County Commissioners Court
approves submission of the grant application for the Cluster Collections Pilot Project to the Office

of the Governor, Criminal Justice Division.

Passed and Approved this _Zﬁﬁ)ay of %%_ , 2005.

Attest: Commissioners Court of
Tom Green County:
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Dianna Spieker, C10, CCT
Tom Green County Treasurer

FY 2004 Monthly Report
December, 2004

THE STATE OF TEXAS ()
COUNTY OF TOM GREEN (}

The Treasurers’ Monthly Report includes, but not limited to, money received and disbursed; debts due to (if
known) and owed by the county; and all other proceedings in the treasurer's office that pertain to the
Financial Standing of Tom Green County. {LGC 114.026(a)(b)}

The Treasurers Books and the Auditor's General Ledger agree. The Bank Statements have been
reconciled; any adjustments have been noted.

Therefore, Dianna Spieker, County Treasurer of Tom Green County, Texas, who being fully sworn, upon
oath says that the within and foregoing report is true and comrect to the best of her knowledge.

Eiled with accompanying vouchers this the 25th day of January 2005.

Dianna Spieker, Treastirer, Tom Green County / Date

The Treasurers’ Monthly Report and the Bank Reconciliation have been submitted for Audit. The Cash
Balances Agree with the Auditor's Records. {LGC 114.026(b)}

Pcfo—"“ (fio Jos

Stanley P. Liles, Auditor~Fam Green Counfy / Date

Commissioners” Court having reviewed the Treasurer's Report as presented, having taken reasonable steps
to ensure its accuracy and based upon presentations of the Treasurer's Office, the County Auditor’s office,
and other county staff, approve the report, subject to the independent auditor's review and request that it be
filed with the official minutes of this meeting. {LGC 114.026(c)}

In addition, the below signatures affim that the Treasurers' Report complies with statutes as referenced.

{LGC 114.026(d)} (

Mike Brown, County Judge / Date

Redeh Woelecfors Absen}

Ralph Hoelbcher, Comm. Pct. #1 / Date

S < Heof

Steve Flo¥d, Comm. Pct. #3 /Dalk./ /
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Tom Green Auditar

BUDGETARY

ACCOUNTING

MODULE

Combined Statement of Receipts and Disburmements - All Funds

The Software Graup, Inc.

For Transactions December 01, 2004 - December 31, 2004

Total NON RESIDENTIAL PROGRAM

EFTPS/PAYROLL TAX CLEARING
094-000-1010 - CASH

Total EFTPS/PFAYROLL TAX CLEARING

PAYROLL FUND
055-000-1010 - CASH

Total PAYROLL FUND

COURT AT LAW_EXCESS STATE SUPPLEMENT
056-000~1010 - CASH

Total COURT AT LAW_EXCESS STATE SUPPLEMENT
LEOSE TRAINING FUND

097-000-1010 - CASH

097-000-1515 - MBIA

Total LEOSE TRAINING FUND

CHILD RESTRAINT STATE FEE FUND
098-000-1010 - CASH

Total CHILD RESTRAINT STATE FEE FUND
98 I&S/CERT OBLIG SERIES

099-000-1010 - CASH

099-000-1516 - FUNDS MANAGEMENT

Total 98 I&S/CERT OBLIG SERIES

COUNTY ATTORNEY LEOSE TRAINING FUND
100-000-1010 - CASH

Total COUNTY ATTORNEY LEOSE TRAINING FUND
98 I&S/TAX ANTICIPATION NOTE

101-000-1010 - CASH

101-000-1516 - FUNDS MANAGEMENT

Total 98 I&S/TAX ANTICIPATION NOTE

CONSTABLE PRCT 1 LEOSE TRAINING FUND
102-000-1010 - CASH

Total CONSTABLE PRCT 1 LEOSE TRAINING FUND

3 0.00
$ 0.00
$ 0.00
$ 8,375.85
$ 8,375.85
$ 3,120.95
$ 3,120.95
$ 843.17

9,121.26
$ 9,964.43
$ 1,447.25
5 1,447.25

§ 206,553.1¢6
36,187.99

3 763.09
$ 763.09
$ 9,144.21

10,103.52
$ 19,247.73
5 505.49
$ 505.49

80 . 9

....... Receipts
§ 0.00
$ 306,635.40

$ 306,635.40

$ 1,835,470.25

$ 11.00
$ 11.00
$ 5.66

13.56
$ 19.22
$ 640.75
$ 640.75
$ 645,973.01

51.23
$ 646,024.24
$ 5.32
$ 5.32
$ 26,836.28

14.30
$ 26,850.58
5 4.89
5 4.89

18

.Disbursements
§ 0.00
$ 306,635.40
$ 306,635.40

$ 1,828,426.86

$ 163.61
$ 163.61
§
$ 0.00
5
H 0.00
$
$ 0.00
$
$ 0.00
$ 2.26
$ 2.26
$
$ 0.00

$ 0.00
$ 0.00
$ 0.00
$ 15,419.24
5 15,419 .24
$ 2,968.34

H 2,968 .34
$ 848.83
9,134.82

$ 9,983.65
$ 2,088.00
H 2,088.00
$ 852,526.17
36,239 .22

5 BBB,765.39
$ 768.41
$ 768.41
$ 35,978.23
10,117.82

$ 46,096.05
$ 510.38
$ 510.38

/




Tom Green Auditor

BUDGETARY

ACCOUNTING

MODULE

Combined Statement of Receipts and Disbursements - All Funds

The Software Group, Inc.

For Transactions December 01,

2004 - December 31, 2004

CONSTABLE PRCT 2 LEOSE TRAINING FUND
103~-000-1016 - CASH

Total CONSTABLE PRCT 2 LEOSE TRAINING FUND

CONSTABLE PRCT 3 LEOSE TRAINING FUND
104-000-1010 - CASH

Total CONSTABLE PRCT 3 LEOSE TRAINING FUND

CONSTABLE PRCT 4 LEOSE TRAINING FUND
105-000-1010 - CASH

Total CONSTABLE PRCT 4 LEOSE TRAINING FUND

ADMIN FEE FUND - CCP 102.072

106-000-1010 - CASH

106-000~1515 - MBIR

Total ADMIN FPEE FUND - CCP 102.072

TCOMI
108~000-1010 - CASH

Total TCOMI

JUVENILE DEPERRED PROCESSING FEES
110-000-1010 - CASH

Total JUVENILE DEFERRED PROCESSING FEES

COUNTY JUDGE EXCESS CONTRIBUTIONS 25.0016
111-p00-~31010 - CASH

Total COUNTY JUDGE EXCRSS CONTRIBUTIONS 25.001¢

DNA CCP 102.020
112-000-1010 - CASHE

Total DNA CCP 102.020

PASS THRU GRANTS
113-006-1010 - CASH

Total PASS THRU GRANTS

CHILD SAFETY FEE TRANSPORTATION CODE 502.173
114-000-1016 - CASH

Total CHILD SAFETY FEE TRANSPORTATION CODE 502.173

$ 741.79
5 741.79
s 2,665.90
$ 2,665.50
s 3,000.74
3 3,000.74
$ 6,344.12

39,012.60
$ 45,356.72
$ 9,075.45
s 9,075.45
$ 11,273.29
5 11,273.29
$ 965.23
5 965,23
5 0.00
$ 6.00
$ 102.20
$ 102.20
$ 5.00
$ 0.00

vev....Receipts
§ €.98
§ 6.98
§ 16.59
§ 18.58
§ 20.94
] 20.94
$ 1,732.90
58.00
g 1,790.90
H 23,118.00
S 23,118.00
$ 59,99
§ 59.99
5 5.25
$ 5.25
§
$ 0.00
s 42.65
$ 42.85
§
$ 0.00

5

$ 0.00
$

§ 0.00
$

§ 0.00
s 28.31
§ 28.31
$ 8,538.60
§ B,539 .60
§ 20.10
s 20.10
§ 109 .88
H 108 .88
§

§ 0.00
§

$ 0.00
$

5 -0.00

5 748.77
$ 748.77
§ 2,664 .49
$ 2,684.49
$ 3,021.68
B 3,021.68
$ B,048.71

39,070.60
$ 47,119.31
§ 23,653,858
$ 23,653 .85
$ 11,313.18
s 11,313.18
s 860 .60
3 BE0 .60
S 0.00
$ 0.00
§ 144.85
5 144 .85
$ 0.00
§ 0.00

/
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Tom Green Auditor

BUDGETARY

ACCOUNTING

MODULE

Combined Statement of Receipts and Disbursements - All Funds

The Software Group, Inec.

Poxr Transactions December D1, 2004 - December 31, 2004

LONESTAR LIBRARY GRANT
201-000-1010 - CASH

Total LONESTAR LIBRARY GRANT

TROLLINGER FUND
202-000-1010 - CASH

Total TROLLINGER FUND

LIBRARY EXPANSION
203-000-1010 - CASH

Total LIBRARY EXPANSION

COURTHOUSE LANDSCAPING
301-000~1010 - CASH

Total COURTHOUSE LANDSCAPING

SHERIFF FORFEITURE FUND
401-B00-1010 - CASH

Total SHERIFF FORFEITURE FUND

STATE AID/REGIONAL
506-000-1010 - CASH

Total STATE AID/REGICRAL

SALARY ADJUSTMENT/REGIONAL
561-006-1010 - CASH

Total SALARY ADJUSTMENT/REGICNAL

COMMUNITY CORRECTIONS/REGIONAL-STATE FUNDS
502-000-1010 - STATE FUNDS - CASH

Total COMMUNITY CORRECTIONS/REGICGNAL-STATE FUNDS

COMMUNITY CORRECTIONS/REGIONAL
5063-C00-1010 - CASH

Total COMBUNITY CORRECTIONS/REGIONAL

1IV-E PROGRAN/REGIONAL
504-000-1610 - £ PROGRAM/REGIONAL - CASH

Total IV-E PROGRAM/REGIONAL

NON -RESIDENTIAL/REGIONAL
505-000-1010 - RESIDENTIAL/REGIONAL -~ CASE

YOL.

o

§ 366.22
$ 366.22
$ 382,307.39

5 382,307.39

§ 51,068.71
5 51,068.71
s 130.60
% 130.80
$ 25,833,67
$ 25,833.67
$ 711.23
3 711.23
s 710.84
s 710.84
s 8,083.02
K 8,083.02
$ 33,525.46
H 33,525.46
$ 92,787.46
$ 92,787.46
H 1,688.80

....... Receipts
$ 5.14
§ 5.14
$ 3,346.86
$ 3,346.66
$ 176 .48
$ 176.48
S 0.52
H] 0.32
$ 106,43
5 109.43
$ 5,756.1%
S 5,758.19
$ 478.20
5 478.20
$ 5,143.89
s 5,143.99
$ 242.11
$ 242.11
s 300.72
$ 300.72
S 10.50

. .Diebursementa
5

S c.o0¢
$ 158.54
§ 158.54
§ 13,276.32
[ 13,276.32
3

H .00
$ 47.00
$ 47.00
H 4,826._68
§ 4,826.68
$ 1,146.98
$ 1,146 .98
$ 2,723 .84
§ 2,723.84
$ 20,808 .13
s 20,808.13
$ 569 .61
§ 569.61
$ 3.05

5 371.36
§ 371.3¢
§ 385,496.11
§ 385,496.11
$ 37,968.87
$ 37,968.87
] 131.52
$ 131.52
$ 25,896,110
$ 25,896.10
S 1,642.74
] 1,642.74
§ 42.06
$ 42.06
$ 10,503.17
$ 10,503.17
§ 12,959.44
§ 12,959.44
S 92,518.57
$ 92,518.57
[ 1,696.25



Tom Green Auditoer

BUDGETARY

ACCOUNTING

HODULE

Combined Statement of Receipts and Disbureements - All Funde

The Software Group, lnc.

For Transactions December 01, 2004 - December 31, 2004

Total NON-RESIDENTIAL/REGIONAL

PROGRESSIVE SANCTIONS JPO/REGICNAL
50€6-000-1010 - CASH

Total PROGRESSIVE SANCTIONS JPO/REGIONAL

PROGRESSIVE SANCTIONS LEVELS 123/REGIONAL
507-000-1010 - CASEH

Total PROGRESSIVE SANCTIONS LEVELS 123 /REGIONAL

AYUDAR DONATIONS
586-000-1010 - CASE

Total AYUDAR DONATIONS

CHALLENGE GRANT
581-000-1010 - CASH

Total CHALLENGE GRANT

TEXAS YOUTH COMMISSION
582-000-1010 - CASH

Total TEXAS YOUTH COMMISSION

IV-E PROGRAM
583-000-1010 - E PROGRAM - CASH

Total IV-E PROGRAM

POST ADJUDICATION FACILITY
584-000-1010 - CASH

Total POST ADJUDICATION FACILITY

AYUDAR/SUBSTANCE ABUSE PROGRAM
585-000-1010 - CASH

Total AYUDAR/SUBSTANCE ABUSE PROGRAM

STATE AID
586-000-1010 - CASH

Total STATE AID

COMMUNITY CORRECTIONS
587-000-31010 -~ CASH

YOL.

80

$ 1,688.80
5 -730.97
$ ~730.97
$ -241.88
$ ~241.98
$ €,534.92
§ 6,534.92
$ 0.00
$ 5.00

5 101,588.32

] 711, 888.92

$ 711,888.92

5 32,740.21
s 32,740.21
s 27,531.28
3 27,531.28
$ 9,641.79
$ $,641.79
$ 47,090.44

PR Receipts
$ 10.50
§ 2,452.64
$ 2,452.64
$ 1,757.27
$ 1,757.27
$ £0.63
§ 40.63
§

$ 0.00
$ 641.58
$ 641.58
$ 4,287.42
$ 4,287.42
§ 203.55
s 203.55
$ §,412.99
$ B,412.99
$ B,635.90
$ B, 625.90
$ 23,027.35

o, 981

..Disbursements
§ 3,05
$ 2,428.19
$ 2,420.19
§ 2.73
g 2.73
$ 11.82
g 11.82
§

§ 0.00
§ 20,378.32
] 20,378.32
$ 4,199 .38
$ 4,199 .38
$ 59 .20
$ 59.20
$ 6,005.52
$ §,005.52
$ 24,929.31
$ 24,929.31
5 6,700.58

$ 1,696.25
$ -706.52
$ -708 .52
$ 1,512.56
$ 1,512.56
$ 6,563.,73
3 €,563.73
] 0.00
$ 0.00
$ 81,862.58
$ 81,862.58
$ 711,976.96
$ 711,876.96
$ 32,084.56
$ 32,864 .56
H 29,938.78
$ 2%,838.75
$ -6,461.62
$ -6,461.62
$ 63,417.21

@,



BUDGETARY

ACCOQUERETIHNG

8 0DULE

Combined Statement of Receipte and Disbursements - All Fuads

The Software Group, Inc. For Transactions December 01,

2004 - December 31, 2004

Total COMMUNITY CORRECTIONS

SALARY ADJUSTMENT
588-000-1010 -~ CASH

Total SALARY ADTUSTHMENT

FAMILY PRESERVATION
589-000-1010 - CASH

Total PAMILY PRESERVATION

POST ADJUDICATION FACILITY
599-000-1010 - CASH

Total POST ADJUDICATION FACILITY

PROGRESSIVE SANCTIONS LEVELS 123
591-000-1010 - CASH

Total PROGRESSIVE SANCTIONS LEVELS 123

PROGRESSIVE SANCTIONS JPO
582-000~101C - CASH

Total PROGRESSIVE SANCTIONS JPO

PROGRESSIVE SANCTIONS ISJPO
593-000-1010¢ - CASH

Total PROGRESSIVE SANCTIONS ISJPO

TOTALS -~ ALL FUNDE

Prev Mo Balance

$ 47,090.44
s 15,230.26
$ 15,230.26
5 17,128.66
$ 17,128.66
$ 3,960.06
$ 3,960.06
$ 11,147.60
$ 11,147.60
5 11,698.43
$ 11,696.43
$ 1,290.932
$ 1,290.82

.+....Receipts

s 23,027.3%
5 B, 290.43
s B,290.43
$ 6,156.07
4 6,198.07
B 24.861
$ 24.61
[ 2,782.78
H 2,782,789
I3 11,573.39
$ 11,573.39
$ Z,212.41
3 2,212.41

5 6,700.58
$ 10,303.35
$ 10,303.35
§ 5,052.28
S 5,052.28
$ 7.16
$ 7.16
$ 94.30
§ 94.30
$ 13,749.13
s 13,749.13
$ 2,624.93
$ 2,624.93

$ €3,417.21
$ 13,217.34
$ 13,217.34
$ 18,274 .45
$ 18,274 .45
$ 3,977.51
§ 3,977.51
$ 13,836.08
$ 13,836.08
H 9,522.69
$ 9,522.69
§ B78.40
§ 878.40

$ 14,829,150.47

EEEmARNESsTEERES
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